
Bid Tabulation
ITB 27-21
LOW VOLTAGE SUPPLIES
Latoria Kenniebrew, Buyer
kenniebrewl@jccal.org

UOM MFG. NAME & NO. PACKAGING PRICE PRICE 
1 WALL MOUNT BRACKET V1,V3 CASE | P/N 6K-DWCV1WM EA  $                                            49.99  $                                                  49.41 
2 JUNCTION BOX FOR V1,V3 HOUSING | P/N 6K-V1JUNC EA  $                                            49.99  $                                                  47.11 
3 1.3MP/MPA/2.8-12MM/OUT/IR/DOM | P/N 6K-V5661TIR EA  $                                            47.66  $                                                232.18 
4 1-PORT SERIAL DEV SERV. | P/N 7N-UD11001R1 EA  $                                          234.88  $                                                170.10 
5 RHINO 4200 HARD CASE KIT | P/N 7D-1835374 EA  $                                          172.08  $                                                210.33 
6 5MP/VANDM/IR/3.4-10M/IP66/-25C | P/N 6K-MV950TIR EA  $                                          212.78  $                                                564.37 
7 EDGE IP CAMERA, 2.8MM FIXED LE | P/N 6K-VF25W28 EA  $                                          570.93  $                                                603.45 
8 2.1MP,CAAS,VNDOM/4MM,IR,WDR |  P/N 6K-VF25IR464 EA  $                                          610.47  $                                                614.94 
9 2.1MP,CAAS,VNDOM/8MM,IR,WDR | P/N 6K-VF25IR864 EA  $                                          622.09  $                                                563.22 

10 2.1MP 4MM IND IR IP DOM 12/POE |  P/N 6K-MD72I4V EA  $                                          569.77  $                                                142.52 
11 2.1MP 4MM IND IP DOM 12/POE | P/N 6K-MD724V EA  $                                          144.17  $                                                177.00 
12 48MP PANO 4X7.2MM LNS OTDR DME |  P/N 6K-PZV2M72T EA  $                                          179.06  $                                             3,709.18 
13 USB2.0 TO DVI-I/VGA ADAPTER | P/N TC-U244001R EA  $                                       3,752.31  $                                                  89.64 
14 12 FT HDMI V1.4 CABLE W/ETH | P/N 0E-HDMI12 EA  $                                            90.69  $                                                  12.36 
15 35 FT HDMI V1.4 CABLE W/ETH | P/N 0E-HDMI35 EA  $                                            31.38  $                                                  31.02 
16 50 FT HDMI V1.4 CABLE W/ETH | P/N 0E-HDMI50 EA  $                                            51.15  $                                                  50.56 
17 19" LED MONITOR VGA HDMI BNC |P/N 0E-19LED EA  $                                          127.90  $                                                126.43 
18 22" LED MONITOR VGA HDMI BNC |P/N 0E-22LED EA  $                                          201.15  $                                                198.84 
19 13-37" FM ARTICULATING MOUNT |P/N 0E-40APM1337 EA  $                                            34.87  $                                                  34.47 
20 312 TERMINAL STRIP EA  $                                              5.45  $                                                    5.39 
21 1/4 720P IP INDR DOME 2.8MM-10 | P/N DD-CMVUD720N EA  NO BID  NO BID 
22 CAMVU 720P WDR DN IP CAMERA PO |P/N DD-DMCVB720W EA  $                                          737.20  $                                                728.72 
23 DCAMVU 3602 IP DOME CAM POE | P/N DD-DMCV3602A EA  $                                          995.34  $                                                983.90 
24 SD ADVANCED 32CH HYBRID DVR 4T | P/N DD-DMSDEXC32 EA  NO BID  NO BID 
25 16WAY DVMR 1.5 TERABYTE W/NETW | P/N DD-DS2PD1615 EA  $                                       7,131.38  $                                             7,049.41 
26 9WY DVMR 750GB NW AUD DVD 120P | P/N DD-DS2PD9750 EA  $                                       5,382.56  $                                             5,320.99 
27 DV-IP NV1 ENC/DEC/VIDEO SERVER | P/N DD-DVIPNV1A EA  $                                       1,346.51  $                                             1,331.03 

28 16 CH VIDEO SERVER CIP 0TB | P/N DD-DVIPNV4 EA  $                                       6,647.67  $                                             6,571.26 
29 KYBRD W/JYSTCK F/SD SERIES DVR | P/N DD-KBC2 EA  $                                          463.94  $                                                458.61 

 $                                     30,463.37  $                                          30,076.44 

DIVERSIFIED SUPPLY (DSI) 
NEGOTIATED

GROUP I: CAMERA'S, MONITORS & VIDEO SUPPLIES                                                                                                                                            

DIVERSIFIED SUPPLY (DSI)

GROUP 1: TOTAL

mailto:kenniebrewl@jccal.org


UOM PRICE PRICE 
1 3/4" REC STL DR TERM 1/2" WHT P/N GI-8080TW EA  $                                              5.45  $                                                    5.39 
2 SURF MINI 1-1/4" TERM WHT FLNG | P/N GI-100TWGW EA  $                                              5.45  $                                                    5.39 
3 SURF MNT 1-1/4" GAP TERM WHT | P/N 7939WG-WH EA  $                                              6.15  $                                                    6.08 
4 SURF MNT 1-1/4" GAP TERM GRAY | P/N 7939WG-GY EA  $                                              6.40  $                                                    6.32 
5 SURF MNT 1-1/4" GAP TERM BRN | P/N 7939WG-BR EA  $                                              6.15  $                                                    6.08 
6 HOLDUP BTN MOM SPDT 3 SCR TERM | P/N 0E-HBMOMSD3T EA  $                                            17.43  $                                                  17.23 
7 #6 ZONE DIGITAL COMM | P/N SK-5104 EA  $                                          345.99  $                                                397.69 
8 4CHANNELS STAND ALONE | P/N FL-411UDAC EA  $                                          377.99  $                                                434.47 

 $                                          771.01  $                                                878.65 

UOM PRICE PRICE 
1 MINPROX RDR GRY PGTAIL WIEGOUT | P/N HU-5365EGP00 EA  $                                              5.45  $                                                    5.39 
2 PRXPRO RDR WIEG/NO KEYPD-GRY | P/N HU-5355AGN00 EA  $                                              5.45  $                                                    5.39 
3 RP40 MLTCLS SE, PRK, WIEG,PIG,BK | P/N HU-920PTNNK0 EA  $                                              6.40  $                                                    6.32 
4 1-CH HANDHELD X-MTTR | P/N LN-D22A 1-BTTN EA  $                                              6.15  $                                                    6.08 
5 1-CH REC W/RELAY OUTPUT P/N LN-D67 EA  $                                              6.15  $                                                    6.08 

 $                                            29.60  $                                                  29.26 

UOM PRICE PRICE 
1 PULL STATION DUAL ACTION P/N FL-BG12 EA  $                                            39.52  $                                                  39.07 
2 ADDR PULL STATION DUAL ACTION | P/N SK-PULLDA EA  $                                          108.13  $                                                106.89 
3 "L"VRSN OF LEF3-DOOR RLSE VRSN | P/N AJ-LEF3L EA  $                                          233.71  $                                                231.02 

 $                                          381.36  $                                                376.98 

UOM PRICE PRICE
1 16CAM POWER SPLY/2 24V4A XFMR | P/N AX-ALTV2416 EA ALTRONIX EACH  $                                          131.38  $                                                129.87 
2 24VAC P/S 4AMP MAX 4 OUTPUT | P/N AX-ALTV244 EA ALTRONIX EACH  $                                            82.55  $                                                  81.60 
3 CAMERA POWER SUPPLY 8 CAMERA | P/N AX-ALTV248 EA ALTRONIX EACH  $                                            84.87  $                                                  83.90 
4 24VAC/3.5AMP/4 FUSED OUTPUTS | P/N AX-ALTV244UL EA ALTRONIX EACH  $                                            94.17  $                                                  93.09 
5 24VAC/3.5AMP/8 FUSED OUTPUTS | P/N AX-ALTV248UL EA ALTRONIX EACH  $                                            99.99  $                                                  98.84 
6 ALTV2416ULX 24VAC 7AMP MAX | P/N AX-TV2416ULX EA ALTRONIX EACH  $                                          169.76  $                                                167.80 
7 16.5VAC, 45VA TRANSFORMER | P/N EK-TRG1640 EA ELK PRODUCTS EACH  $                                            25.57  $                                                  25.28 
8 TRANSFMRLIFE WTYLED 24/40VA | P/N EK-TRG2440 EA ELK PRODUCTS EACH  $                                            30.22  $                                                  29.87 
9 1500VA/900W/8 OUT/LCD/AVR UPS | P/N 0E-1500V8VRD EA BOX TECHNOLOGIES EACH  $                                          267.43  $                                                264.36 

10 1000VA/600W/9 OUT/LCD/AVR UPS | P/N 0E-1000V9VRD EA BOX TECHNOLOGIES EACH  $                                          182.55  $                                                180.45 
 $                                       1,168.49  $                                             1,155.06 

GROUP 5: POWER SUPPLIES

GROUP 2: BURGLAR ALARM PANELS & ACCESSORIES                                                                                                                                              

GROUP 3: ACCESS CONTROLS                                                                                                                                           

GROUP 3: TOTAL

GROUP 5: TOTAL

GROUP 2: TOTAL

GROUP 4: FIRE ALARM                                                                                                                                          

GROUP 4: TOTAL



UOM PRICE PRICE
1 12V 7AH SLA BATTERY | P/N IM-1270 EA ULTRATECH EACH  $                                            18.02  $                                                  17.82 
2 12V 7AH SLA BATTERY F1 |P/N PW-PS1270 EA POWERSONIC EACH  $                                            20.92  $                                                  20.68 
3 12V 7AH SLA BATTERY |P/N UZ-NP712 EA HONEYWELL EACH  $                                            25.57  $                                                  25.28 
4 12V 26AH SLA BATTERY NB | P/N PW-PS12260NB EA POWERSONIC EACH  $                                            77.90  $                                                  77.00 
5 12V 24AH SLA BATTERY NB | P/N UZ-NP2412B EA YUSA EACH  $                                          119.76  $                                                118.38 
6 12V 18AH SLA BATTERY F2 | P/N IM-12180 EA ULTRATECH EACH  $                                            42.73  $                                                  42.24 
7 12V 17.2AH SLA BATTERY NB | UZ-NP1812B EA YUASA EACH  $                                            76.73  $                                                  75.85 
8 12V 18AH SLA BATTERY NB |P/N PW-PS1218 0NB EA POWERSONIC EACH  $                                            59.29  $                                                  58.61 
9 12V 55AH SLA BATTERY |P/N PW-PS12550U EA POWERSONIC EACH  $                                          202.31  $                                                199.99 

10 12V 12AH SLA BATTERY | P/N IM-12120 EA ULTRATECH EACH  $                                            33.36  $                                                  32.98 
11 12V 12AH SLA BATTERY F2 | P/N PW-PS12120 EA POWERSONIC EACH  $                                            37.20  $                                                  36.77 
12 12V 35AH SLA BATTERY NB | P/N PW-PS12350 EA POWERSONIC EACH  $                                          112.78  $                                                111.48 
13 12V 4.5AH SLA BATTERY | P/N IM-1240 EA ULTRATECH EACH  $                                            12.78  $                                                  12.63 
14 12V 4AH SLA BATTERY | P/N UZ-NP412 EA YUSA EACH  $                                            22.08  $                                                  21.83 

 $                                          861.43  $                                                851.54 

UOM PRICE PRICE
1 24V OR 28VAC 100VA TRNF IN ENC | P/N AX-T2428100C EA ALTRONIX EACH  $                                            80.22  $                                                  79.30 
2 1-CALL ACCESS SENTRY SYSTEM | P/N AJ-LEM1DLS EA AIPHONE EACH  $                                          183.71  $                                                181.60 
3 AL600ULX W/MOM5 INTRFCE INSTLD | P/N AX-AL600ULM EA ALTRONIX EACH  $                                          258.13  $                                                255.16 
4 AL600ULX BOARD ONLY 6AMPS | P/N AX-AL600ULXB EA ALTRONIX EACH  $                                          173.24  $                                                171.25 
5 END OF LINE RELAY | P/N BK-EOLR1 EA SYSTEM SENSOR EACH  $                                            23.24  $                                                  22.98 
6 REQUEST TO EXIT PIR – WHITE | P/N CK-IS310WH EA HONEYWELL EACH  $                                            77.90  $                                                  77.00 
7 DOOR RELAY FOR LAFB | P/N AJ-RYPA EA AIPHONE EACH  $                                            11.38  $                                                  11.25 
8 SURF MNT PLASTIC DOOR STATION | P/N AJ-LED EA AIPHONE EACH  $                                            30.22  $                                                  29.87 
9 IVISION+ WIRELS INTERCOM W/VID | P/N OP-IVPDH EA OPTEX EACH  $                                          465.06  $                                                459.71 

10 HANDHELD UNIT FOR IVISION+ | P/N OP-IVPHU EA OPTEX EACH  INCLUDED IN ITEM ABOVE  INCLUDED IN ITEM ABOVE  
11 DOOR UNIT FOR IVISION+ | P/N OP-IVPDU EA OPTEX EACH  $                                          124.99  $                                                143.67 

 $                                       1,428.09  $                                             1,431.79 

UOM PRICE PRICE
1

24/4 CAT5E CM WH 1M BX | P/N WG-63301101
EA HONEYWELL GENESIS 

10001F
EACH

 $                                            90.69  $                                                  89.64 

2 24/4 CAT5E CM BL 1M BX | P/N WG-63301106 EA HONEYWELL GENESIS 
10001F

EACH  $                                            90.69  $                                                  89.64 

3 23/4PR CAT6 CMR/FT4 1M BX WHT | P/N WG-63601101 EA HONEYWELL GENESIS 
10001F

EACH  $                                            90.69  $                                                  97.70 

4
23/4PR CAT6 CMR/FT4 1M BX BLU | P/N WG-63601106

EA HONEYWELL GENESIS 
10001F

EACH
 $                                          168.52  $                                                166.66 

5
24/4 C5E CMP 1M BX WH | P/N WG-50881101

EA HONEYWELL GENESIS 
10001F

EACH  $                                          252.31  $                                                249.41 

6
24/4 C5E CMP 1M BX BL | P/N WG-50881106

EA HONEYWELL GENESIS 
10001F

EACH
 $                                          252.31  $                                                249.41 

7 23/4PR CAT6 CMP/FT6 1M BX WHT | P/N WG-63611101 EA HONEYWELL GENESIS 
10001F

EACH  $                                          329.06  $                                                325.28 

GROUP 6: BATTERIES

GROUP 6: TOTAL

GROUP 8: CABLES

GROUP 7: INTERCOM POWER SUPPLIES & ACCESSORY EQUIPMENT

GROUP 7: TOTAL



UOM PRICE PRICE
8

23/4PR CAT6 CMP/FT6 1M BX BLU | P/N WG-63611106
EA HONEYWELL GENESIS 

10001F
EACH

 $                                          329.06  $                                                325.28 

9
18/4+22/12 STR 1OAS AC CMR JKT | P/N WG-21961002

EA HONEYWELL GENESIS 
10001F

EACH
 $                                          747.66  $                                                739.07 

10 18/4+22/12 STR 1OAS AC CMP JKT | P/N WG-31961002 EA HONEYWELL GENESIS 
10001F

EACH  $                                          880.22  $                                                870.10 

11
22/4 SOL JKT 5C BX WHT | P/N WG-11035501

EA HONEYWELL GENESIS 
10001F

EACH
 $                                            49.99  $                                                  49.41 

12
18/2 STR JKT 5C BX WHT | P/N WG-11185501

EA HONEYWELL GENESIS 
10001F

EACH
 $                                            69.76  $                                                  68.95 

13 18/4 STR JKT 5C BX WHT | P/N WG-11195501 EA HONEYWELL GENESIS 
10001F

EACH
 $                                          129.06  $                                                127.57 

14
23/4PR CAT6+ CMR 1M RLBX BLU | P/N WG-50922106

EA HONEYWELL GENESIS 
10001F

EACH
 $                                          209.29  $                                                206.89 

15
23/4PR CAT6+ CMR 1M RLBX WHT | P/N WG-50922101

EA HONEYWELL GENESIS 
10001F

EACH
 $                                          209.29  $                                                206.89 

16 22/4 STR OAS 5C BX GRY | P/N WG-12045509 EA HONEYWELL GENESIS 
10001F

EACH  $                                            82.55  $                                                  81.60 

17
22/4 SOL JKT FPL 5C BX RED | P/N WG-41015504

EA HONEYWELL GENESIS 
10001F

EACH
 $                                            51.15  $                                                  50.56 

18
18/2 SOL JKT FPL 5C BX RED | P/N WG-41065504

EA HONEYWELL GENESIS 
10001F

EACH
 $                                            68.59  $                                                  67.80 

19
18/2 SOL JKT FPLP 5C BX RED | P/N WG-45065504

EA HONEYWELL GENESIS 
10001F

EACH
 $                                            70.13  $                                                  67.80 

20 18/4 SOL JKT FPL 5C BX RED | P/N WG-41075504 EA HONEYWELL GENESIS 
10001F

EACH
 $                                          123.24  $                                                121.83 

21
18/4 SOL JKT FPLP 5C BX RED | P/N WG-45075504

EA HONEYWELL GENESIS 
10001F

EACH
 $                                          130.22  $                                                128.72 

22 18/6 SOL JKT FPL 5C RED | P/N WG-41085504 EA HONEYWELL GENESIS 
10001F

EACH  $                                          186.03  $                                                183.90 

23 18/6 SOL JKT FPLP 5C RL RED | P/N WG-45085004 EA HONEYWELL GENESIS 
10001F

EACH  $                                          189.52  $                                                187.34 

24
16/2 SOL FPL 5C BX RED | P/N WG-41115504

EA HONEYWELL GENESIS 
10001F

EACH
 $                                          104.64  $                                                103.44 

25
16/2 SOL JKT FPLP 5C BX RED | P/N WG-45115504

EA HONEYWELL GENESIS 
10001F

EACH
 $                                          108.13  $                                                106.89 

26 16/4 FIRE 500 BOX SOLID | P/N WG-41125504 EA HONEYWELL GENESIS 
10001F

EACH  $                                          199.99  $                                                197.69 

27 16/4 SOL JKT FPLP 5C RL RED | P/N WG-45125004 EA HONEYWELL GENESIS 
10001F

EACH
 $                                          201.15  $                                                198.84 

28 14/2 SOL JKT FPL 5C RL RED | P/N WG-41135004 EA HONEYWELL GENESIS 
10001F

EACH
 $                                          159.29  $                                                157.46 

29
14/2 SOL JKT FPLP 5C RL RED | P/N WG-45135004

EA HONEYWELL GENESIS 
10001F

EACH
 $                                          161.62  $                                                159.76 

30
14/4 SOL JKT FPL 5C RL RED | P/N WG-41145004

EA HONEYWELL GENESIS 
10001F

EACH
 $                                          303.48  $                                                299.99 

31
14/4 SOL JKT FPLP 5C RL RED | P/N WG-45145004

EA HONEYWELL GENESIS 
10001F

EACH
 $                                          309.29  $                                                305.74 

GROUP 8: CABLES (Continued)



UOM PRICE PRICE
32

18/6 STR OAS 5C BX GRY | P/N WG-12165509
EA HONEYWELL GENESIS 

10001F
EACH

 $                                          227.90  $                                                225.28 

33 18/6 STR JKT CL2P 5C BX BGE | P/N WG-31165512
EA HONEYWELL GENESIS 

10001F
EACH

 $                                          212.78  $                                                210.33 

34 18/6 STR OAS CMPCL2P 5C BX BGE | P/N WG-32165512
EA HONEYWELL GENESIS 

10001F
EACH

234.81$                                          232.17$                                                
 $                                       7,023.11  $                                             6,949.04 

 $                                     42,126.46  $                                          41,748.76 

Signature Page 

DIVERSIFIED SUPPLY, INC.
121 CLOVERDALE DRIVE, ALABASTER, AL 35007 | MELODIE MARETH | P: 205.620.9299    
E:  MMARETH@DIVERSIFIEDSUPPLY.COM

Guaranteed maximum Discount available if contract is renewed for 2nd year 
Guaranteed maximum Discount available if contract is renewed for 3rd year 
Percent Mark-up for suceeding years  

1%
2%
15%

YES
Affidavit of Contractor
Non-Collusion Affidavit

CONTACT INFORMATION

YES
YES
NO

Notification of Intent to Respond
Equal Opportunity Certification Form

REQUIRED FORMS
YES
YES

GROUP 8: CABLES (Continued)

DELIVERY IS GUARANTEED NOT LATER THAN            5             DAYS AFTER ORDER DATE.

Bid Bond

Statement of Compliance with Alabama Code 31-13-9
Price Sheet

GROUP 8: TOTAL

Maximum Discount

YES

YES

GRAND TOTAL GROUPS 1 - 8
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